
 

ICUDDR Track at ISSUP Conference 
Nairobi, Kenya 

Dec 10-13, 2018 
 

Time Monday Presenter 

2:00 Welcome and overview Michal Miovsky 

2:30 
Developing a stand-alone DDR 
graduate education program: The 
experience of Kenyatta University 

Beatrice Kathungu 

3:30 Break 
 

4:00 
The experience of Developing DDR 
education programs in Nigeria 

Martin Agwogie  
Michael Ezenwa 
Bolanle Ola 
Moses Audu 
Gboyega Abikoye 

5:00 Close 
 

   

 
Tuesday 

 

9:00 Welcome Back/ recap of Day One 
Beatrice Kathungu 
 

9:15 
Developing DDR education in South 
Africa 

Rehana Kader 
Charl Davids 
Shaheema Allie 
Lameze Abrahams 

10:15 Break 
 

10:45 
Program Development in African 
countries 

Tanzania 
Botswana 
Mozambique 

12:30 Lunch 
 

2:00-3:00 

Development of an integrated 
multidisciplinary undergraduate DDR 
course: The importance of inclusion of 
DDR in general education, Kenyatta 
experience 

Francisca Ongecha 

3:00-3:30 Break  



 

3:30 -5:30 

Master Class: Initiating a new program 
on drug demand reduction, identifying 
champions, engaging students and 
other factors critical in new program 
development   

Michal Miovsky 
 

   

 
 

Wednesday  

9:00 Welcome Back recap of Day Two Rehana Kader 

9:15 

Program Development in African 
countries 
 
Developing a Drug Demand Reduction 
program: Thailand’s Experience 

Ghana 
Rwanda 
Senegal 
 
P. Chucharoen 

10:15 Break  

10:45 Panel on Practicum experience  

Muchiri Karega 
Donald Kokonya 
Beatrice Kathungu 
Mary Kamina  
 

11:45 

Facilitated Discussion: What do 

universities in Africa need (from each 

other, from others) to succeed in 

developing drug demand reduction 

education programs 

Jane Marie 

D’Ongolo and Kim 

Johnson 

12:45 

 

Lunch 

 

2:00 
Facilitated Discussion: Organizing a 
regional network of universities that 
teach in drug demand reduction 

Jane Marie 
D'Ongolo, Beatrice 
Kathungu 

3:00 Closing remarks/ next steps Michal Miovsky 

3:30 Adjourn large group 
 

3:30 -5:30 

 
Master Class addressing motivation for 
change: A master class for university 
students Igor Koutsenok  

 


